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From James McManus, author of the bestselling Positively Fifth Street, comes the definitive story of the
game that, more than any other, reflects who we are and how we operate.

Cowboys Full is the story of poker, from its roots in China, the Middle East, and Europe to its ascent as a
global—but especially an American—phenomenon. It describes how early Americans took a French parlor
game and, with a few extra cards and an entrepreneurial spirit, turned it into a national craze by the time of
the Civil War. From the kitchen-table games of ordinary citizens to its influence on generals and diplomats,
poker has gone hand in hand with our national experience. Presidents from Abraham Lincoln to Barack
Obama have deployed poker and its strategies to explain policy, to relax with friends, to negotiate treaties
and crises, and as a political networking tool. The ways we all do battle and business are echoed by poker
tactics: cheating and thwarting cheaters, leveraging uncertainty, bluffing and sussing out bluffers, managing
risk and reward.

Cowboys Full shows how what was once accurately called the cheater’s game has become amostly honest
contest of cunning, mathematical precision, and luck. It explains how poker, formerly dominated by
cardsharps, is now the most popular card game in Europe, East Asia, Australia, South America, and
cyberspace, as well as on television. It combines colorful history with firsthand experience from today’s
professional tour. And it examines poker’s remarkable hold on American culture, from paintings by Frederic
Remington to countless poker novels, movies, and plays. Braiding the thrill of individual hands with new
ways of seeing poker’s relevance to our military, diplomatic, business, and personal affairs, Cowboys Full is
sure to become the classic account of America’s favorite pastime.
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From reader reviews:

Preston Sloan:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this particular aren't like that. This Cowboys Full: The Story of Poker book is readable by means of
you who hate those straight word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable studying
experience without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer of
Cowboys Full: The Story of Poker content conveys objective easily to understand by many people. The
printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different in the form of it. So , do you even now
thinking Cowboys Full: The Story of Poker is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Jessica Nakagawa:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Cowboys Full: The Story of
Poker that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading behavior
all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world considerably better then how they react
in the direction of the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading practice only for the geeky man or
woman but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for every you who want to start reading
through as your good habit, you could pick Cowboys Full: The Story of Poker become your own personal
starter.

Don Morris:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Cowboys Full: The Story of Poker
guide written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that can be understand by
anyone who all read the book. Written with good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and
producing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still doubt Cowboys Full: The Story of
Poker as good book but not only by the cover but also by content. This is one guide that can break don't
ascertain book by its protect, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come
on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Lawrence Abbate:

You could spend your free time to read this book this book. This Cowboys Full: The Story of Poker is simple
to bring you can read it in the park, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did not include much space to
bring the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save
the actual book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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