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At eighteen, Sierra Berutelli watched in disappointment as the man of her dreams walked into her father's
office. Despite his striking good looks, she knew that if he was connected to her father, he couldn't be the
man for her. But then that disappointment changed to horror when she realized that her father had tried to kill
the dashing stranger. Rushing the battered man to the hospital, she did everything in her power to save him.
She was relieved that he wasn't working with father, but she knew she could never have a future with the
handsome stranger if he knew she was related to Joe Berutelli. Now, six years later, after changing her last
name and breaking off all ties with her father and his friends, Sierra came face to face with the man. He
looked even more amazing, but she had to stay away from him. He was dangerous and she knew he would
hate her if he ever found out she was the daughter of the man who almost killed him. Drake Harrison
couldn't believe how perfect Sierra was. After searching so many years for the woman who had been by his
side in the hospital, trying to discover her identity, he was ready to give up that dream girl because the real
Sierra was so much more enticing, his ideal match. He didn't understand how she could be warm, passionate,
and yielding to his embrace one moment, then pulling back in fear the next. But he was determined to
discover all of Sierra's secrets.
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Powell:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book specifically book entitled The
Billionaire's Secretive Enchantress your brain will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every
aspect that maybe unknown for but surely can be your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written
in a publication then become one form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get before. The The
Billionaire's Secretive Enchantress giving you one more experience more than blown away your brain but
also giving you useful facts for your better life within this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing
pattern this is your body and mind will be pleased when you are finished examining it, like winning a sport.
Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Vera Gates:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't
work the following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in
the outside search likes. Maybe you answer could be The Billionaire's Secretive Enchantress why because
the wonderful cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions
to pick up this book.

Mattie Martin:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or
even make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or real
their leisure activity. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this The Billionaire's Secretive Enchantress can make you truly feel more interested to
read.

Carolyn Alcantara:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source that filled update
of news. With this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out
your book? Or just seeking the The Billionaire's Secretive Enchantress when you required it?
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