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When one thinks of war, armies of soldiers and assaults with bullets and bombs delivered by deadly
machinery typically come to mind. Throughout human history, however, animals have also played
significant roles in our armed conflicts. In Animals in the Military: From Hannibal's Elephants to the
Dolphins of the U.S. Navy, author John M. Kistler examines these contributions, describing the work of
animals in human warfare throughout time, from lowly insects to birds to elephants.

Drawing on both ancient and modern sources, the book reveals the full scope of heroics and horror
committed by—and against—animal warriors in three unique areas: animals in combat, animals in support,
and animals in incidental and experimental roles. Each chapter describes a single species, chronologically
recounting its fascinating place in human warfare over time, from insects used as stinging projectiles to
message-delivering pigeons.
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From reader reviews:

Carolyn Hoffman:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive
currently, people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded
place and notice by surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a reserve your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading the book, we give you this specific Animals in the Military:
From Hannibal's Elephants to the Dolphins of the U.S. Navy book as starter and daily reading guide. Why,
because this book is greater than just a book.

Michelle Bachman:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Aim to pick
one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't work this is
difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside appear
likes. Maybe you answer may be Animals in the Military: From Hannibal's Elephants to the Dolphins of the
U.S. Navy why because the wonderful cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not
disappoint you actually. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth
sense will directly make suggestions to pick up this book.

Oliver Gerling:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find publication that need
more time to be study. Animals in the Military: From Hannibal's Elephants to the Dolphins of the U.S. Navy
can be your answer given it can be read by an individual who have those short free time problems.

Wanda Jacobsen:

You can obtain this Animals in the Military: From Hannibal's Elephants to the Dolphins of the U.S. Navy by
browse the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve difficulty if you get
difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by simply written or printed but
can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your local
mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information
about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to
choose right ways for you.
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